
From: Wall, Gregory
To: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk; Timsina, Gopal; Vasquez, Ximena (she/her/hers)
Subject: RE: Proof of Payment - Atotech USA, LLC; Docket No. TSCA-04-2023-3002(b)
Date: Wednesday, July 26, 2023 11:20:50 AM
Attachments: Transaction_Details_07_25_2023_13_59.pdf

Payment Workflow Progress.png

Good morning, Ximena, Gopal and Shannon.
 
Atotech received a rejection notice for the wire transfer that it submitted on Monday, July 24 for the
$46,000 payment. It was not entirely clear why the wire was rejected, so Atotech mobilized its
finance team and resubmitted payment. In response, Atotech received the attached documentation
showing the successful confirmation of the second wire transfer on July 25, 2023 at 1:47 pm in the
amount of $46,000.
 
Please kindly update the docket with the attached proof of payment for the Consent Agreement and
Final Order in the matter of Atotech USA, LLC; Docket No. TSCA-04-2023-3002(b).
 
Thank you,  
Greg

  

Gregory Wall
Partner
gwall@HuntonAK.com
p 804.344.7801
m 202.744.5073

Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP
Riverfront Plaza, East Tower
951 East Byrd Street
Richmond, VA 23219

2200 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW
Washington, DC 20037
HuntonAK.com

 

 
This communication is confidential. If you are not an intended recipient, please advise by return email immediately and then delete this message,
including all copies and backups.

 

From: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk <R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk@epa.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 25, 2023 11:46 AM
To: Wall, Gregory <GWall@hunton.com>; R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk
<R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk@epa.gov>; Timsina, Gopal <Timsina.Gopal@epa.gov>; Vasquez,
Ximena (she/her/hers) <vasquez.maria-ximena@epa.gov>
Subject: RE: Proof of Payment - Atotech USA, LLC; Docket No. TSCA-04-2023-3002(b)
 

Caution: This email originated from outside of the firm.
Good morning Greg,
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https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.huntonak.com%2F%3Futm_source%3Desighunton%26utm_medium%3Demail%26utm_campaign%3Desigtracking&data=05%7C01%7CR4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk%40epa.gov%7Ce367b1200fab4c33606f08db8debe328%7C88b378b367484867acf976aacbeca6a7%7C0%7C0%7C638259816495671950%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=iRSInRPYshmwBPvmhHuUJkR6801V3EXukfGc71aIkXo%3D&reserved=0



ATOTECH USA
INCORPOR


Status


Completed


Transaction Information
Account Number/Name


323157629/ATOTECH MAIN
ACCOUNT (DDA)


Transaction made from Template


Enviromental Protection Agency


Method


Wire
Payment Amount


USD 46,000.00
Value Date


07/25/2023


UNITED STATES - US
Beneficiary Bank CountryBank to Bank Transfer


No


Beneficiary
Account Number
68010727
Environmental Protection Agency
UNITED STATES - US


Beneficiary Bank
United States FED ABA
021030004
Federal Reserve Bank of New York
33 Liberty Street
New York, New York 10045
UNITED STATES - US
No ID


Routing/Reference Information


Transaction Details
Atotech USA, LLC


Docket No.


TSCA-04-2023-3002(b)


Bank To Bank
Charges Priority


Remitter No


Date Created


07/25/2023 01:34 PM EDT
Transaction ID


118208644
Bank Reference


5078900206JO0000
Settlement Reference


FED Ref: 0725B1QGC08C019287
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See more

Workflow Progress

¥)  submied
07/25/2023 01:34 PM by FRANCISCO DIAZ

~)  Approved
07/25/2023 01:35 PM by FRANCISCO DIAZ

V) Released
07/25/2023 01:44 PM by Susan Wilson

V) Delivered
07/25/2023 01:46 PM by System

¥)  Completed
07/25/2023 01:47 PM by System

@ Value Date
07/25/2023

@® Method
Wire

Instructed Amount
46,000.00

Instructed CCY
usD.

@ Ordering/Originating Account Number
323157629

‘Ordering/Originating Account Name
ATOTECH MAIN ACCOUNT (DDA)
BankID.

021000021

‘Ordering/Originating Account CCY.
usD.

@ Beneficary D
68010727
Beneficary Neme
Environmental Protection Agency
Beneficary Bank D
021030004

Beneficiary Bank Name.
Federal Reserve Bank of New York

Beneficiary Bank Courry
UNITED STATES OF AMERICA

@ Template Name
Enviromental Protection Agency





Confirming proof of payment received.
 
Thank you and have a pleasant day.
 
Shannon L. Richardson
Shannon L. Richardson | Region 4 RHC
Paralegal Specialist
General/Criminal Law & Cross-Office Support
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency | Region 4
61 Forsyth Street, Atlanta, GA. 30303
Office: 404.562.8929 |
 
From: Wall, Gregory <GWall@hunton.com> 
Sent: Monday, July 24, 2023 6:21 PM
To: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk <R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk@epa.gov>; Timsina, Gopal
<Timsina.Gopal@epa.gov>; Vasquez, Ximena (she/her/hers) <vasquez.maria-ximena@epa.gov>
Subject: Proof of Payment - Atotech USA, LLC; Docket No. TSCA-04-2023-3002(b)
 
Good evening, Ximena, Gopal and Shannon.
 
Please accept this e-mail on behalf of Atotech USA, LLC as the required proof of payment for the
Consent Agreement and Final Order in the matter of Atotech USA, LLC; Docket No. TSCA-04-2023-
3002(b). Confirmation of payment by wire transfer is attached.
 
The wire was submitted with the Respondent’s name and Docket Number for this case to ensure
proper processing. However, after the wire was transferred, Atotech noticed a small typo in the
Beneficiary Name in the attached, which was listed as “U.S. Environmental Protecion Agenc” instead
of “U.S. Environmental Protection Agency.” Atotech attempted to proactively address this issue but
was informed that payment would need to be rejected by the recipient for it to be corrected and
resubmitted.
 
Could you please kindly reply to this email to confirm receipt of the proof of payment, and to also
confirm that the $46,000 payment was properly received. Alternatively, if the payment was rejected,
could you please let me know so that it can be resubmitted promptly.
 
Thank you,
Greg

  

Gregory Wall
Partner
gwall@HuntonAK.com
p 804.344.7801
m 202.744.5073

Hunton Andrews Kurth LLP
Riverfront Plaza, East Tower
951 East Byrd Street
Richmond, VA 23219
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2200 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW
Washington, DC 20037
HuntonAK.com

 
This communication is confidential. If you are not an intended recipient, please advise by return email immediately and then delete this message,
including all copies and backups.
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